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Best Pills launches its new website, bestpills.co.uk/- the new online pharmacology 
website, serving the privacy minded individual. 

London, England (UK), 4/6/2009 - Best Pills Inc is proud to announce the grand 
launching of their new, widely prescribed prescription drug website – bestpills.co.uk. 

The site is unique in its offering of popularly prescribed “discreet” prescription drugs, 
for which there has emerged a large public demand. Best Pills does not require a 
prior prescription on these Rx drugs. Rather, they offer their customers the utmost of 
discretion by providing free, onsite, anonymous medical consultations and customer 
support. 

As Peter Ross, company manager explains, “Best Pills fills a particular niche in the 
pharmacology market, in that it provides its customers with popularly prescribed 
medical drugs, without requiring them to endure the hassle or embarrassment 
associated with their purchase”. 

Peter Ross went on to explain how Best Pills prides itself on its accommodation of 
customer privacy “We understand that many of the drugs which we offer may be 
associated with certain public stigmas, and so we at Best Pills make sure to offer our 
customers the highest of Company standards in regards to privacy and discretion”. 

Best Pills.co.uk employs a 24 hour online customer support team to aid their 
customers in placing their orders. The site also utilizes the internet security services 
of the well known Online security authority, Geo Trust, guaranteeing its customers 
stead-fast protection of all their personal information and private details. Customers 
are able to order their prescriptions online, from the privacy of their own homes, and 
have the products shipped safely and discreetly straight to their front doorsteps. 

About BestPills 
Bestpills.co.uk is an online pharmacy website, offering customers popularly 
prescribed prescription drugs without the need for a prior Rx. Bestpills offers both 
brand name medications, as well as quality generic drugs at discounted prices. Best 
Pills also stocks a variety of popularly proven natural and herbal health supplements. 

Contact Details: http://www.Bestpills.co.uk 
1888 837 4705 

 


