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8 June 2010 – Leading consumer money-saving offers site 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk has announced the introduction of its latest 
range of deals designed to help people save on summer outdoor gear 
and also summer clothing. The site offers shoppers savings at more 
than 300 top stores. 

Included in the new batch of codes and vouchers launched by 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk are savings on specialist outdoor kit through 
new Go Outdoors discount codes. Thanks to the British weather 
improving shoppers can get big bargains on outdoor kit like camping 
gear, hiking boots, cycling kit and more. 

DiscountVouchers.co.uk launches its latest batch of discounted deals 
to help UK shoppers save on essential summer home ware thanks 
to House of Fraser discount codes. So for people who want to get 
bargains like 50% off summer bed linens as well as 20% off House of 
Fraser luggage for anybody thinking of some new suitcases for a 
summer holiday. 

Also included in the new batch of codes launched by 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk are savings like 30% off Nike Air classic 
trainers from JJB Sports as well as 50% off a HP1400 Pressure Washer 
from Halfords. The site is also home to big money-off deals from 
leading clothing outlet Boden. 



Simon Terry, managing director of DiscountVouchers.co.uk, says, “Our 
new batch of deals which we have acquired for this week feature some 
outstanding money-off deals at leading retailers like House of Fraser, 
Go Outdoors and Boden. So as the summer weather rolls around we 
can help people to save on essential summer gear.” 

DiscountVouchers.co.uk offers a regularly updated range of vouchers 
and codes for savings at stores such as Boots, Currys, John Lewis, 
Sainsbury’s, Lastminute.com, Dorothy Perkins, New Look and more. 
The website is searchable by retailer name, latest deal and most 
popular deal, making it easier for customers to find the best value 
deals in the shortest time. 

To see all the latest discount deals visit www.discountvouchers.co.uk. 
/ends. 

About DiscountVouchers.co.uk 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk features the latest offers and savings from a 
growing range of retailers, all updated in real time. Designed to help 
consumers save money with both leading high street brands and 
specialist retailers, DiscountVouchers.co.uk offers one of the widest 
choices of money saving offers. 

Part of ASAP Ventures Ltd, the company behind the award winning 
Carrentals.co.uk price comparison site, DiscountVouchers.co.uk is 
committed to offering a growing range of the best savings available 
online. 

For more information visit www.discountvouchers.co.uk 
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